

**RAPPAHANNOCK REGIONAL JAIL
PROCUREMENT OFFICE
PO Box 3300
Stafford, VA 22555
Phone: (540) 288-5273 Fax: (540) 288-0819**

NOTICE OF CONTRACT AWARD

DATE: June 14, 2021
COMMODITY NAME: Uniforms, Clothing and Accessories
CONTRACT NUMBER: 2021-UC&A
CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2021– June 30, 2022
RENEWAL OPTIONS: Four (4) one-year renewal options

AWARDED VENDORS: **Page 1 of 2**

Southern Police Equipment
7609 Midlothian Turnpike
Richmond VA 23235

Chrissy Hoyt
P: 804-323-1855
F: 804-323-5067
chrissy@southernpoliceequipment.com

Municipal Emergency Services, Inc.
Db a Lawmen Supply Company
of NJ, Inc.
7150 Airport Hwy.
Pennsauken Township NJ 08109

Chris Ferrari
P: 856-488-4499
F: 800-436-6019
chris.ferrari@lawmensupply.com

BKT Uniforms
4306 Electric Rd., Suite L-2
Roanoke VA 24018

Terry Mathis
P: 804-400-0048
F: 540-400-0056
uniforms@bkt.roacoxmail.com

F3 Tactical, Inc.
14231 Willard Road #300
Chantilly VA 20151

Leanna Kennebeck
P: 703-378-3685
F: 855-941-4422
Leanna@FC3Tactical.com

American Uniform Sales, Inc.
5601-C General Washington Dr.
Alexandria VA 22312

Shashi Butani
P: 703-941-9382
F: 703-941-9384
sbutani@americanuniform.com

**RAPPAHANNOCK REGIONAL JAIL
PROCUREMENT OFFICE
PO Box 3300
Stafford, VA 22555
Phone: (540) 288-5273 Fax: (540) 288-0819**

NOTICE OF CONTRACT AWARD

DATE: June 14, 2021
COMMODITY NAME: Uniforms, Clothing, and Accessories
CONTRACT NUMBER: 2021-UC&A
CONTRACT PERIOD: July 1, 2021– June 30, 2022
RENEWAL OPTIONS: Four (4) one-year renewal options

AWARDED VENDORS: **Page 2 of 2**

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc. Gail Walker-Keen
701 Columbia Blvd. P: 321-360-3030
Titusville FL 32780 F: 321-360-3049
bids@lawmens.net

Galls, LLC David Scheve
1340 Russell Cave Road P: 859-800-1402
Lexington KY 40505 F: 877-914-2557
rose-lindsay@galls.com

Aspetto, Inc. Walter Clarke
1691 Jefferson Davis, Hwy. P: 540-547-8487
Fredericksburg VA 22401 F: 540-300-2669
Walter.clarke@aspettoinc.com

Pressed 4 Ink Joey Murray
325 Wallace Land P: 540-693-4023
Fredericksburg VA 22408 uniforms@pressed4ink.com

TERMS: Net 45 days
DELIVERY: See Bid Tab for A.R.O.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION, CONTACT:
Lisa Walker
Procurement Officer
lwalker@rrj.state.va.us

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
S-1	Women's BDU Shirt FLYING CROSS Item # FX5100W 86 Color: LAPD Navy Sizes: 32 - 52	No	No Bid	0	\$ 58.75	30	\$ 56.99	Not Specified	\$ 60.66	45	\$ 57.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 39.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 77.00	30
S-2	Men's BDU Shirt FLYING CROSS Item # FX5100 86 Color: LAPD Navy Sizes: Small - 6X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 58.75	30	56.99	Not Specified	\$ 60.66	45	\$ 57.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 39.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 77.00	30
S-3	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: 5.11 Color: Dark Navy (724) Model #: 71049 Size: Small - 5X-Large (Tall and Regular length)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.55	30	No Bid	0	\$ 27.35	45	\$ 35.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 36.95	30
S-4	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: 5.11 Color: Dark Navy (724) Model #: 71049 Size: Small - 5X-Large (Tall and Regular length)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 35.55	30	No Bid	0	\$ 33.35	45	\$ 45.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 31.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 42.95	30
S-5	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: 5.11 Color: Various Model #: 71049 Size: Small - 5X-Large (Tall and Regular length)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.55	30	No Bid	0	\$ 27.35	45	\$ 35.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 36.00	30
S-6	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: 5.11 Color: Various Model #: 71049 Size: Small - 5X-Large (Tall and Regular length)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 35.55	30	No Bid	0	\$ 33.35	45	\$ 45.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 31.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 42.95	30
S-7	Polo Shirt, Long Sleeve Make: 5.11 Color: Dark Navy (724) Model #: 72049 Size: Small - 3X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 32.80	30	No Bid	0	\$ 36.00	45	\$ 40.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 40.00	30
S-8	Polo Shirt, Long Sleeve Make: 5.11 Color: Dark Navy (724) Model #: 72049 Size: Small - 3X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 37.80	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	\$ 50.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 34.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 46.00	30
S-9	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: CornerStone Color: Various Model #: CS410 Size: Small - 5X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 23.60	30	\$ 29.50	Not Specified	\$ 22.00 Small - XL, \$ 28.00 2x-4X, 5X	30	\$ 28.50, 5X not available	30	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 25 not available in 4X	30
S-10	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: CornerStone Color: Various Model #: CS411 Size: Small - 4X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 23.60	30	\$ 29.50	Not Specified	\$ 22.00 Small - XL, \$ 28.00 2x-4X, 5X	30	\$ 28.50	30	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 25.00	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
S-11	Polo Shirt, Short Sleeve Make: Condor Color: Olive Drap (001) Model #: 101144 Size: Small - 4X-Large	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 34.20	30	\$ 35.00, 4X not available	30	No Bid	0	\$ 25.00 Small - 2X, \$27.00 3X, no 4X	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 59 not available in 4X	30
S-12	Polo Shirt, Long Sleeve Make: Condor Color: Olive Drap (001) Model #: 101065 Size: Small - 4X-Large	No	No Bid		No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 39.20	30	\$ 59.00, 4X not available	30	No Bid	0	\$ 29.50 Small - 2X, \$ 31.50 3X, no 4X	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 69 not available in 4X	30
EB-1-A	3 lines of Text Rappahannock Regional Jail Firearms Instructor	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.85	30	\$ 12.00	Not Specified	\$ 12.00	14	\$ 9.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 6.00	30
EB-1-B	2 lines of Text Rappahannock Regional Jail	No	No Bid	0	\$ 5.50	30	\$ 11.00	Not Specified	\$ 12.00	14	\$ 6.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 7.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 6.00	30
EB-1-C	3 lines of Text Rappahannock Regional Jail Gang Unit	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.85	30	\$ 10.00	Not Specified	\$ 12.00	14	\$ 9.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 6.00	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
T-1	Women's Trouser FLYING CROSS Item # FX57300W Color: LAPD Navy HEMMED Sizes: 4 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 58.10	30	\$ 56.99	Not Specified	\$ 58.19	45	\$ 50.15	30	No Bid	0	\$ 40.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-2	Men's Trouser FLYING CROSS Item # FX57300 Color: LAPD Navy HEMMED Sizes: 28 - 58	No	No Bid	0	\$ 58.10	30	\$ 56.99	Not Specified	\$ 58.19	45	\$ 50.15	30	No Bid	0	\$ 40.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-3	Women's Trouser FLYING CROSS Item # FX57300W Color: LAPD Navy UNHEMMED Sizes: 4 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 58.10	30	\$ 56.99	Not Specified	\$ 52.19	45	\$ 43.15	30	No Bid	0	\$ 40.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-4	Men's Trouser FLYING CROSS Item # FX57300 Color: LAPD Navy UNHEMMED Sizes: 28 - 58	No	No Bid	0	\$ 58.10	30	\$ 56.99	Not Specified	\$ 52.19	45	\$ 43.15	30	No Bid	0	\$ 40.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-5	Men's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5251 Color: LAPD Navy HEMMED Sizes: See Attachment T-5	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 23.99	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-6	Men's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5251 Color: Charcoal HEMMED Sizes: See Attachment T-5	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 23.99	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-7	Men's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5251 Color: Olive Green HEMMED Sizes: See Attachment T-5	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 23.99	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-8	Men's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5251 Color: Various HEMMED Sizes: See Attachment T-5	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 23.99	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
T-9	Women's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5272 Color: LAPD Navy HEMMED Sizes: 2 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 29.00	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-10	Women's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5272 Color: Charcoal HEMMED Sizes: 2 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 29.00	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-11	Women's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5272 Color: Olive Green HEMMED Sizes: 2 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 29.00	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-12	Women's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5272 Color: Various HEMMED Sizes: 2 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 29.00	30	\$ 33.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-13	Women's Tactical Trouser PROPPER Item # F5272 Color: Various UNHEMMED Sizes: 2 - 24	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 23.20	Not Specified	\$ 21.00	30	Unhemmed not available	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-14	BDU Trouser PROPPER - Zipper Fly Item # F5205 Color: Various Sizes: XS-4X	No	No Bid	0	\$ 30.50	30	\$ 28.60	Not Specified	\$ 24.50	30	\$ 29.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
T-15	Tactical Trouser CONDOR Item # 608 Color: OD Green Sizes: Various, to be specified when ordered	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 43.20	45	\$ 46.50	30	No Bid	0	\$ 15.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
B-1	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8776-1 Size: Small	No	\$ 18.77	30-45	\$ 20.85	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	45	\$ 25.15	30	\$ 19.13	30-60	\$ 20.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-2	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8777-1 Size: Medium Small	No	\$ 18.77	30-45	\$ 20.85	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	45	\$ 25.15	30	\$ 19.13	30-60	\$ 20.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-3	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8778-1 Size: Large	No	\$ 18.77	30-45	\$ 20.85	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	45	\$ 25.15	30	\$ 19.13	30-60	\$ 20.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-4	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8779-1 Size: X-Large	No	\$ 18.77	30-45	\$ 20.85	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	45	\$ 26.00	30	\$ 19.76	30-60	\$ 20.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-5	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8779-2 Size: 2X-Large	No	\$ 19.87	30-45	\$ 20.85	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	45	\$ 26.00	30	\$ 19.76	30-60	\$ 20.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-6	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8779-3 Size: 3X-Large	No	\$ 24.17	30-45	\$ 23.60	30	No Bid	0	\$ 28.00	45	\$ 28.25	30	\$ 21.46	30-60	\$ 21.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-7	Web Belt Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: Size: 4X, 5X, 6X	Yes	\$ -	Unavailable	No Bid	Unavailable	No Bid	0	\$ 32.00 (PFNDB)	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 20.25	30-45 NP 238 4X	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-8	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8781-1 Size: Small	No	\$ 14.97	30-45	\$ 15.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 17.05	30	\$ 12.43	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-9	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8782-1 Size: Medium	No	\$ 14.97	30-45	\$ 15.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 17.05	30	\$ 12.43	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A,R,O
B-10	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8783-1 Size: Large	No	\$ 14.97	30-45	\$ 15.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 17.05	30	\$ 12.96	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-11	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8784-1 Size: X-Large	No	\$ 14.97	30-45	\$ 15.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 17.05	30	\$ 12.43	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-12	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8784-2 Size: 2X-Large	No	\$ 14.97	30-45	\$ 15.25	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 17.45	30	\$ 12.43	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-13	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8784-3 Size: 3X-Large	No	\$ 16.99	30-45	\$ 17.95	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 19.30	30	\$ 14.67	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-14	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8784-4 Size: 4X-Large	No	\$ 16.99	30-45	\$ 17.95	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	\$ 19.30	30	\$ 14.67	30-60	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-15	Velcro Belt, Inner Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: Size: 5X - 6X	Yes	\$ -	Unavailable	No Bid	Unavailable	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-16	Leather Belt Make: Dutyman Color: Black Model #: 1611 Size: 28-56	Yes	Boston Leather, 28-44 \$17.27, 46-54 \$18.77, 56 & up, \$19.57	30-45	\$ 23.20	30	\$ 24.00	Not Specified	\$ 26.00	45	\$ 25.00	30	\$ 20.25 up to 44", \$ 23.23 46-52, \$ 24.53 54-60 (Min order 5)	30-60	\$ 22.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-17	Belt Buckle Make: Dutyman Color: Nickel/Silver Model #: 9031	Yes	Boston Leather, SKU 6591-sil \$5.80	30-45	\$ 2.65	30	\$ 2.50	Not Specified	\$ 4.00	45	\$ 5.00	30	5.16 (Min of 5)	30-60	\$ 2.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
B-18	Belt Buckle Make: Dutyman Color: Gold Model #: 9032	Yes	Boston Leather, SKU 6591-gld \$5.80	30-45	\$ 2.65	30	\$ 2.50	Not Specified	\$ 4.00	45	\$ 5.00	30	5.16 (Min of 5)	30-60	\$ 2.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A,R,O
O-1	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: Small	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-2	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: Medium	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-3	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-4	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-5	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: 2X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-6	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: 3X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-7	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: 4X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-8	Jacket, Softshell PORTWEST Item # UTK50 Color: Black Sizes: 5X-Large	No	No Bid	0	\$ 38.20	30	No Bid	0	\$ 42.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 48.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 35.50	30
O-9	Coveralls Make: Item # Color: Various Sizes: Small - 5X-Large	Yes *	No Bid	0	\$ 25.00	30 Redcap Item # CP40. It is available in medium blue, navy, and white	No Bid	0	\$ 72.00 (NAVY to 4X)	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 26.50 Redicap#CT10	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A,R,O
SP-1	T-Shirts, Short Sleeve, 50/50 Blend Color: Various Model #: Size: Small - 6X-Large Regular	No	No Bid	0	5.55 (PC61)	30	No Bid	0	\$ 6.15 Small - XL, \$ 10.5 2X - 4X	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 6.00	30
SP-2	T-Shirts, Long Sleeve, 50/50 Blend Color: Various Model #: Size: Small - 6X-Large Regular	No	No Bid	0	8.30 (PC61LS)	30	No Bid	0	\$ 6.15 Small - XL, \$ 10.5 2X - 5X	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30
SP-3	T-Shirts, Short Sleeve, 50/50 Blend Color: Various Model #: Size: Small - 6X-Large	No	No Bid	0	5.55 (PC61)	30	No Bid	0	\$ 6.15 Small - XL, \$ 10.5 2X - 4X	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 7.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 7.00	30
SP-4	T-Shirts, Long Sleeve, 50/50 Blend Color: Various Model #: Size: Small - 6X-Large	No	No Bid	0	8.30 (PC61LS)	30	No Bid	0	\$ 6.15 Small - XL, \$ 10.5 2X - 5X	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 9.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 9.50	30
SP-5	Pullover Sweatshirt w/ Hoods Make: Port & Company Color: Various Model #: PC90H Size: Small - 5X-Large	No	No Bid	0	19.40 (PC90H)	30	No Bid	0	\$ 26.00 up to 4X	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 17.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 21.50	30
SP-6-A	RRJ Facilities Ink: To Be Determined based upon garment color. One side only	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 4.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30
SP-6-B	GANG UNIT Lettering and LOGO previously designed, printing on both front and back	No	No Bid	0	\$ 15.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30
SP-6-C	SRT Lettering and LOGO previously designed, printing on both front and back	No	No Bid	0	\$ 15.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30
SP-6-D	Screen Prining on Garments, front side, lettering only	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30
SP-6-E	Screen Prining on Garments, back side, lettering only	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 4.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30
SP-6-F	Screen Prining on Garments, front side, LOGO	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30
SP-6-G	Screen Prining on Garments, back side, LOGO	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30
SP-6-H	Screen Prining on Garments, back side, LOGO	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
SP-6-1	Screen Prining on Garments, back side, LOGO	No	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	14	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 5.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.50	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A.R.O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A.R.O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A.R.O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A.R.O
P-1	RRJ Shoulder Patch Size: 5" T by 3 1/2"	No	No Bid		\$ 3.40	45-60	\$ 1.33	Not Specified	\$ 8.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.75	30
P-2	RRJ Shoulder Patch Size: 3 3/8" T by 2 1/2" W	No	No Bid		\$ 3.65	45-60	\$ 1.06	Not Specified	\$ 8.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.45	30
P-3	RRJ Shoulder Patch Size: 5" tall by 3 1/2" Wide, Color: Sub-Dued Green	No	No Bid		\$ 3.40	45-60	\$ 1.80	Not Specified	\$ 8.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.25	30
P-4	RRJ Shoulder Patch Size: 5" tall by 3 1/2" Wide, Color: Sub-Dued Green With hook loom on back of patch	No	No Bid		\$ 3.40	45-60	\$ 2.40	Not Specified	\$ 8.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 3.00	30
P-5	Badge Patch, Size: 3 1/4" T by 2 1/4" W Color: Silver and Black	No	No Bid		\$ 2.10	45-60	\$ 1.21	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.50	30
P-6	Badge Patch, Size: 3 1/4" T by 2 1/4" W Color: Silver and Black With hook loom on back of patch	No	No Bid		\$ 2.10	45-60	\$ 1.85	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30
P-7	Badge Patch, Size: 3 1/4" T by 2 1/4" W Color: Gold and Black	No	No Bid		\$ 2.10	45-60	\$ 1.21	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.50	30
P-8	Badge Patch, Size: 3 1/4" T by 2 1/4" W Color: Gold and Black With hook loom on back of patch	No	No Bid		\$ 2.10	45-60	\$ 1.85	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A.R.O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A.R.O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A.R.O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A.R.O
P-9	Badge Patch, (SRT) Size: 3 1/4" T by 2 1/4" W Color: Green and Black	No	No Bid		\$ 2.10	45-60	\$ 1.17	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.50	30
P-10	Badge Patch, (SRT) Size: 3 1/4" T / 2 1/4" W Color: Green and Black With hook loom on back of patch	No	No Bid		\$ 2.10	45-60	\$ 2.15	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30
P-11	Shoulder Patch, (SRT) Size: 5" T by 4" W Color: Green and Black With hook loom on back of patch	No	No Bid		\$ 5.45	45-60	\$ 2.46	Not Specified	\$ 6.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 2.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 3.95	30
P-12	USA Flag, Size: 2" T by 3 1/4: W Color: Red. White and Blue	No	No Bid		\$ 0.95	30	\$ 0.75	Not Specified	\$ 2.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 0.75	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30
P-13	USA Flag, Size: 2" T by 3 1/4: W Color: Red. White and Blue	No	No Bid		\$ 0.95	30	\$ 0.75	Not Specified	\$ 2.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 0.75	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 1.00	30
P-14	Name Tag Size: 1" T by 4: W Color: LAPD Blue Embroidered with either Silver or Gold thread. Lettering is 1/2" tall	No	No Bid		\$ 7.50	30	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 6.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30
P-15	Name Tag Size: 1" T by 4: W Color: Dark Green Embroidered with Black thread. Lettering is 1/2" tall	No	No Bid		\$ 7.50	30	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 6.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 8.00	30
					\$ 48.80		\$ 19.99	\$ -	\$ 94.00	\$ 615.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 30.50	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 40.90	\$ 450.00

Entire Category Awarded

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
I-1	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Silver Model #: Custom 3/8" cutout letters	No	No Bid		No Bid	0	\$ 11.44	Not Specified	\$ 8.00	45	\$ 9.00	30	\$ 10.54 (3/8S-RRJ)	30-60	\$ 6.25	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-2	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Silver Model #: P601 (Officer 1st Class)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 3.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-3	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Silver Model #: P615 (Master Jail Officer)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.50	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 3.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-4	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P602 (Corporal)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-5	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P604 (Sergeant)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-6	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P610 (1st Sergeant)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-7	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P1300 (Lieutenant)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.70	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.84	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-8	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P1302 (Captain)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.70	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.84	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-9	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P1304 (Major)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
I-10	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Silver Model #: P1305 (Lieutenant Colonel)	No	No Bid		\$ 4.85	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.95	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-11	Rank Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P1306 (Superintendent)	No	No Bid		\$ 11.40	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 7.00	30	\$ 5.39	30-60	\$ 4.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-12	FTO Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Silver Model #: P2435	No	No Bid		\$ 4.70	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.84	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-13	FTO Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P2434	No	No Bid		\$ 4.70	30	\$ 4.95	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 4.84	30-60	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-14	SRT Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Silver Model #: P2525	No	No Bid		\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.55	30-60	\$ 6.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
I-15	SRT Insignia Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: P2524	No	No Bid		\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.25	30	\$ 6.55	30-60	\$ 6.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
					\$ 76.65		\$ 71.40		\$ 87.50		\$ 86.50		\$ 72.50		\$ 59.50		\$ -		\$ -	

Entire Category Awarded

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
AP-1	5 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 1 (one)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75 A7140-C	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 12.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-2	10 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 2 (two)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75 A7140-D	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 13.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-3	15 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 3 (three)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75 A7140-E	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-4	20 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 4 (four)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75 A7140-F	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 15.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-5	25 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 5 (five)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75 A7140-G	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 16.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-6	30 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 6 (six)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75 A7140-H	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 17.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-7	35 Year Award, Sworn Make: Blackinton Color: See Comments Model #: A7140 Number of Stars: 7 (seven)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 6.75	30	\$ 13.00	Not Specified	\$ 6.82	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.54	30-45	\$ 18.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-8	5 Year Award, Civilian Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: APRE15877-09 Number in Center: 5 (five)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 14.25	30	\$ 13.70	Not Specified	\$ 45.00	45	No Bid	0	\$ 13.04	30-60	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-9	10 Year Award, Civilian Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: APRE15877-09 Number in Center: 10 (ten)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 14.25	30	\$ 13.70	Not Specified	\$ 45.00	45	No Bid	0	\$ 13.04	30-60	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
AP-10	15 Year Award, Civilian Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: APRE15877-09 Number in Center: 15 (fifteen)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 14.25	30	\$ 13.70	Not Specified	\$ 45.00	45	No Bid	0	\$ 13.04	30-60	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-11	20 Year Award, Civilian Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: APRE15877-09 Number in Center: 20 (twenty)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 14.25	30	\$ 13.70	Not Specified	\$ 45.00	45	No Bid	0	\$ 13.04	30-60	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-12	25 Year Award, Civilian Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: APRE15877-09 Number in Center: 25 (five)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 14.25	30	\$ 13.70	Not Specified	\$ 45.00	45	No Bid	0	\$ 13.04	30-60	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
AP-13	30 Year Award, Civilian Make: Premier Emblem Color: Gold Model #: APRE15877-09 Number in Center: 30 (thirty)	No	No Bid	0	\$ 14.25	30	\$ 13.70	Not Specified	\$ 45.00	45	No Bid	0	\$ 13.04	30-60	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A,R,O
E-1	Radio Holder Make: Motorola Color: Black Model #: PMLN5838A	Yes	\$ 42.99	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 79.00	90	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	30-45 Part # NP560	No Bid	0	\$ 65.00	30
E-2	Handcuff Case Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8878-1	No	\$ 11.67	30-45	\$ 12.40	30	No Bid	0	\$ 14.91	45	No Bid	0	\$ 10.14	30-60	\$ 11.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 22.00	30
E-3	Latex Glove Case Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8887-1	No	\$ 8.47	30-45	\$ 7.65	30	No Bid	0	\$ 8.98	45	No Bid	0	\$ 7.44	30-60	\$ 8.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 16.00	30
E-4	OC Spray Holder Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8877-1	No	\$ 11.87	30-45	\$ 11.80	30	No Bid	0	\$ 13.55	45	No Bid	0	\$ 10.75	30-60	\$ 11.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 25.00	30
E-5	Belt Keepers Make: Uncle Mikes Color: Black Model #: 8865-2	No	\$ 11.77	30-45	\$ 8.95	30	No Bid	0	\$ 10.36	45	No Bid	0	\$ 8.33	30-60	\$ 9.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 16.00	30
E-6	Holster, Left Hand Make: Blackhawk Color: Black Model #: 44H100BK-L	No	\$ 74.90	30-45	\$ 88.80	30	No Bid	0	\$ 76.26	45	No Bid	0	\$ 64.46	30-60	\$ 68.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 134.00	30
E-7	Holster, Right Hand Make: Blackhawk Color: Black Model #: 44H100BK-R	No	\$ 74.90	30-45	\$ 88.80	30	No Bid	0	\$ 76.26	45	No Bid	0	\$ 64.46	30-60	\$ 68.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 134.00	30
E-8	Holster, Right Hand Make: Blackhawk Color: Black Model #: 430500BK-R	No	\$ 97.87	30-45	\$ 98.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 107.15	45	No Bid	0	\$ 79.97	30-60	\$ 85.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 165.00	30
E-9	Holster, Left Hand Make: Blackhawk Color: Black Model #: 430500BK-L	No	\$ 97.87	30-45	\$ 98.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 107.15	45	No Bid	0	\$ 79.97	30-60	\$ 85.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 165.00	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
E-10	Holster Paddle Make: Blackhawk Color: Black Model #: 44H909BK	No	No Bid		No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 20.14	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.14	30-60	\$ 13.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 29.35	30
E-11	Handcuff Case Make: ITAC Color: Black Model #: ITAC-MP00	No	No Bid		No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 30.00	30
E-12	OC Spray Make: Fox Color: NA Model #: 152FTSDB	No	No Bid		\$ 15.00	30	No Bid	0	\$ 20.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 12.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 17.99	30
E-13	Name Plate Make: TBD Color: Silver and Gold Lettering Enamel: Blue Model #: TBD Size: 1/2" by 2 1/2"	Yes	No Bid		\$ 10.20	30	\$ 9.66	Not Specified	\$ 10.36	45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.17	30	\$ 6.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 11.50	30
E-14	Ball Caps Make: Pacific Hero Wear Color: Black Model #: 498F Size: Small/Medium	No	No Bid		\$ 17.70	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30
E-15	Ball Caps Make: Pacific Hero Wear Color: Black Model #: 498F Size: Large/X-Large	No	No Bid		\$ 17.70	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 10.00	30
E-16	Ball Caps Make: Hero Waer Color: Black Model #: 498F Size: Small/Medium	No	No Bid		\$ 22.70	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 15.00	30-45 The committee choose P4I due to quality	No Bid	0	\$ 19.00	30
E-17	Ball Caps Make: Pacific Hero Wear Color: Black Model #: 498F Size: Large/X-Large	No	No Bid		\$ 22.70	30	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 15.00	30-45 The committee choose P4I due to quality	No Bid	0	\$ 19.00	30
E-18	Ball Caps Make: LawPro Color: Black Model #: HW787 Size: Adjustable	No	No Bid		No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 14.00	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 4.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 11.75	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
E-19	Ball Caps Make: LawPro Color: Black Model #: HW787 Size: Adjustable	No	No Bid		No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 14.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 5.50	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 14.75	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A,R,O
R-1	Handcuffs Make: Smith & Wesson Color: Silver, Nickel Finish Model #: M-100-1	No	No Bid	0	\$ 25.25	30	\$ 27.66	Not Specified	\$ 22.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 18.50	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-2	Handcuffs Make: Peerless Color: Silver, Nickel Finish Model #: 700 or 700C	No	No Bid	0	\$ 25.40	30	\$ 27.66	Not Specified	\$ 23.55	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 19.70	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-3	Handcuff Key Padlock Make: Cuff Lock Color: Red Model #: CUFFLOCK	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 9.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 6.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-4	Double Cuff Make: Monadnock Color: Black Model #: 8220-3-2B Package of 100	No	No Bid	0	\$ 182.15	30	\$ 194.50	Not Specified	\$ 185.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-5	Double Cuff Make: Monadnock Color: White Model #: 8220-3-10B Package of 100	No	No Bid	0	\$ 182.15	30	\$ 194.50	Not Specified	\$ 185.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-6	Human Restraint Kit #7 Make: Human Restraint Type: Leather	No	\$ 359.77	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 420.00	90	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-7	Adjustable Wrist-Waist Restraint , locking Make: Human Restraint Type: Leather Model #: MNDL-401	No	\$ 219.97	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 265.00	90	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-8	Leather Ankle Hobble, locking Make: Human Restraint Type: Leather Model #: AD-305	No	\$ 137.70	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 145.00	90	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-9	Small Restraint Bag Make: Human Restraint Size: 22" x 9" x 9" Model #: RBS-100	No	\$ 43.70	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 40.00	90	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-10	Handcuffs, Oversized Make: Smith & Wesson Color: Silver, Nickel Finish Model #: 110	No	No Bid	0	\$ 45.35	30	\$ 47.66	Not Specified	\$ 49.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 31.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Delivery time frame, A,R,O
R-11	Belly Chain Make: Smith & Wesson Color: Silver, Nickel Finish Model #: 1800	No	No Bid	0	\$ 81.45	30	\$ 93.53	Not Specified	\$ 74.80	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 55.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-12	Leg Irons Make: Smith & Wesson Color: Silver, Nickel Finish Model #: 1900	No	No Bid	0	\$ 45.35	30	\$ 59.33	Not Specified	\$ 46.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 34.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-13	Oversize Leg Irons Make: Peerless Color: Silver, Nickel Finish Model #: 705C	No	No Bid	0	\$ 119.35	30	\$ 118.60	Not Specified	\$ 125.12	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 85.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-14	Weighted Leg Restraint Make: Human Restraint Size: 10 pound Model #: TW-100	No	\$ 118.70	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 112.00	90	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-15	C&S Security Fifth Model Black Box Handcuff Cover Make: C & S Security	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 17.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-16	54" Restraint Chain, Waist Make: Size: 54" Model #:	Yes*	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 74.00	Peerless Model # 7002C	\$ 80.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-17	60" Restraint Chain, Waist Make: Size: 60" Model #:	Yes*	No Bid	0	\$25.00 IS40 350100	30	No Bid	0	\$ 23.00 Peerless 4781-60	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 18.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-18	72" Restraint Chain Make: Chicago Size: 72" Model #: A600	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 15.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 13.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-19	84" Restraint Chain, Waist Make: Size: 84" Model #:	Yes*	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 80.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-20	96" Restraint Chain, Waist Make: Size: 96" Model #:	Yes*	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 75.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-21	High Security Handcuff Make: Chicago Color: Stainless Steel Model #: X22	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 24.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-22	Boot Cuff Leg Irons Make: CTS Thompson Color: Stainless Steel Model #: 5259	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 70.00	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Not what we asked for. Do not award

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
R-23	PT A Bravo Half Shell Matte Helmet Make: PT Helmets Size: S-2XL Color: Black Model #:	No	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-24	Gas Mask, PC50 Series, L Make: Avon Protection Systems Model #: 70501-632	No	No Bid	0	\$ 315.84	30	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 255.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0
R-25	SCARAB Disposable Restraint Cutter Make: ASP Model #: 56225	No	No Bid	0	\$ 27.75	30	No Bid	0	\$ 24.25	45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$ 19.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
WB-1	Badge Case Make: Perfect Fit Model #: PF100-B Color: Black Cutout #: 8 Sizes: 2 5/8" x 4 1/4"	No	\$ 15.97	30	\$ 14.30	30	No Bid	0	\$ 13.55	30	\$ 19.15	45	14.06 (Min of 5)	30	\$ 14.00	30-45	No Bid	0	No Bid	0

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A,R,O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A,R,O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A,R,O
BG-1	Uniform Badge Make: Blackinton Color: Silver, Gold Model #: B296	No	No Bid	0	\$ 48.25	45-60	\$ 50.99	Not Specified	\$ 56.70	45	\$ 60.50	30-45	\$ 52.56	30-60	\$ 50.00	30-45	No Bid	0	\$ 53.45	30
BG-2	Uniform Badge Make: Blackinton Color: Silver, Nickel Model #: B296	No	No Bid	0	\$ 48.25	45-60	\$ 49.70	Not Specified	\$ 52.13	45	\$ 49.50	30-45	\$ 42.87	30-60	\$ 42.00	30-45	No Bid	1	\$ 43.00	30

Item Number	Description	Substitute Permitted	Southern Police	Southern Police Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Lawmen Supply Co. of NJ Inc	Lawmen Supply Delivery time frame, A.R.O	BKT Uniforms	BKT Uniforms Delivery time frame, A.R.O	F3 Tactical	F3 Tactical Delivery time frame, A.R.O	American Uniforms	American Uniforms Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Lawmens & Shooters	Lawmens & Shooters Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Galls	Galls Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Aspetto	Aspetto Delivery time frame, A.R.O	Pressed 4 Ink	Pressed 4 Ink Tactical Delivery time frame, A.R.O
BPV	details outlined in ITB	Yes	\$ 877.70	45	No Bid	0	\$ 926.00	Not Specified	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	No Bid	0	\$1,090.00	30-45	\$ 895.00	45	No Bid	0
			Brand: Survival Armor with or without pouches			Brand: Survival Armor						Brand: Aspetto								

PRICING SCHEDULE

PART II

MANUFACTURER	Less % off of Manufacturers current List	F3 Tactical Inc.	Lawmen/MES	Galls, Inc	Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.	American Unifrom Sales, Inc.	Aspetto, Inc.
511		20%	25%	15%		28%	
ASP			25%	15%			
Bates		22%	25%	15%			
Bianchi		20%	25%				
BlackHawk			25%	15%	30%		
Blackington		30%	25%	15%	33%		
Brownells		5%		15%			
D & K		20%			25%		
Daniel Defense			25%				
Evident							
Fechheimer		30%	25%	20%		36%	
Federal							
Gerber			25%	15%			
GOULD & GOODRICH		30%	25%	15%	20%	28%	
Peerless			25%	15%	15%		
Pelican			25%	15%	10%		
Point Blank Enterprises Inc.			25%	20%		33%	
Premier Emblem		15%	25%	15%	20%		
Propper		30%	25%	15%			
Remington							
Sabre		15%	25%	15%			
Safariland		20%	25%				
Sig Sauer							
Stratton Hats		12%	25%	15%			
Streamlight		30%	25%	15%	30%		
SureFire		20%	25%	15%	22%		
TruSpec			25%	15%			
Uncle Mike's			25%	15%	30%		
UnderArmour			25%	15%			
US PeaceKeeper							

(Bidders may list addition "other" manufacturers by adding

OTHER MANUFACTURER OFFERED	Less % off of Manufacturers current List	F3 Tactical Inc.	Lawmen/MES	Galls, Inc	Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply, Inc.	American Unifrom Sales, Inc.	Aspetto, Inc.
Aimpoint		20%					
Velocity/Mayflower		20%					
Benchmade		30%					
Condor		20%					
Salomon		20%					
Galls				25%			
Smith & Warren					35%		
Dutyman					10%		
AmericanUniform.Com (website)						15%	
militaryluggage.com (website)						15%	
Fechheimer (Vertx)						18%	
Aspetto Inc							30%